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Incidents:  
 
 
09-14-20 
 
At 1106hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1364 to assist a motorist in 
unlocking their vehicle at a business on E. Jackson St. 
 
At 1422hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1365 to assist a motorist in 
unlocking their vehicle at a residence on Lakeview Drive. 
 
At 1632hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1366 for a citizen assist on 
Railroad St. 
 
At 1636hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1367 for a fraud report at a 
residence on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1849hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1368 for a lockout at a residence 
on S. Washington St. 
 
At 2217hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1369 for a harassment complaint 
at a business on S. Washington St. 
 
At 2220hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1370 for a welfare check at a 
residence on S. Washington St. 
 
09-15-20 
 
At 0313hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1372 to assist the Holmes County 
Sheriffs office in Berlin. 
 
At 0630hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1373 for an alarm at a residence 
on S. Crawford St. 
 
At 0739hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1374 for a report theft from a 
business on S. Washington St. 
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At 1636hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1375 for a report of a fight at a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1915hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1376 for a welfare check at a 
residence on S. Monroe St. 
 
At 2133hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1377 for a parking complaint at a 
business on W. Jackson St. 
 
09-16-20 
 
At 1650hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1378 for a lockout at a business 
on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1705hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1379 for a disturbance at a 
residence on N. Crawford St. 
 
At 1937hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1380 for a disturbance at a 
residence on Massillon Road. 
 
09-17-20 
 
At 0026hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1381 to assist the Holmes County 
Sheriffs office in searching for a vehicle driving reckless on Massillon Rd. 
 
At 0547hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1382 for a report of a suspicious 
person on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1144hrs this department responded to call 20MPS1383 for a disturbance at a 
business on Wooster Rd. 
 
At 1710hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1385 for a petty theft at a business 
on SR 39. 
 
At 2040hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1387 for a petty theft at a 
residence on CR 58. 
 
09-18-20 
 
At 1107hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1388 for a funeral escort through 
town to Oak Hill Cemetery. 
 
At 1452hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1389 for an alarm at a business on 
W Jackson St. 
  
At 1755hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1390 for an animal call at a 
residence on S Washington St. 
 
At 2118hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1391 for a welfare check at a 
residence on S Clay St. 
 
At 2134hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1392 for a lockout at a business 
on S Washington St. 



 
At 2218hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1393 for a noise complaint at a 
residence on S Washington St. 
 
At 2316hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1394 for a suspicious vehicle at a 
business on S Washington St. 
 
09-19-20 
 
At 0952hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1395 to unlock a vehicle on 
Hebron St. 
 
At 2039hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1397 for a citizen assist at a 
business on N Washington St. 
 
At 2145hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1398 for a lockout at a residence 
on N Washington St. 
 
At 2232hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1399 for a welfare check at a 
business on S Washington St. 
 
At 2332hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1400 for an argument at a 
residence on S Crawford St. 
 
09-20-20 
 
At 1440hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1401 for a funeral escort on SR 39 
to north on SR 241 
 
At 1642hrs this department responded to call 20MPD1402 for an ATV complaint at a 
residence on S Crawford St. 
 
09-21-20 
 
 
 
 
Accidents:  
 
At 1616hrs for call 20MPD1384 this department responded to a 2 vehicle non-injury 
accident on S Washington St. 
 
At 1548hrs for call 20MPD1396 the department responded to a 2 vehicle non-injury 
crash at a business parking lot on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1713hrs for call 20MPD1403 this department responded to a 1 vehicle non-injury 
accident on Perkins St. 
 
 
 


