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Week Ending 08-14-22 

INCIDENTS: 

08-15-22 
 
At 0007hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1359 for a report of a suspicious 
person at a business on Glen Drive. 
 
At 0920hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1360 for a report of trespassing at 
a business on Glen Drive. 
 
At 1027hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1362 for a citizen assist on the 
Rails to Trails. 
 
At 1100hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1363 to assist a motorist in 
unlocking a their vehicle at a business on Glen Drive. 
 
At 1415hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1364 for a traffic stop on S. 
Washington St. 
 
At 1708hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1365 for a report of a obstructed 
roadway on E Jackson St. 
 
At 1720hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1366 for a report of a motorcycle 
complaint on SR 39.  
 
At 2049hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1367 for a civil standby at a 
business on S Washington St. 
 
08-16-22 
  

http://www.millersburgohio.com/


At 0910hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1368 for a report of domestic 
violence at a residence on W. Jackson St. 
 
At 1659hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1369 for a report of fraud at a 
business on S Washington St. 
 
08-17-22 
 
At 0211hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1370 to assist a citizen at a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 
At 0359hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1371 for a suspicious vehicle on 
N. Washington St. 
 
At 0933hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1372 for a welfare check of a 
resident on CR 58. 
 
At 1338hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1373 to assist a citizen unlock 
their vehicle at a business on S. Washington St.  
 
At 1735hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1374 for a report of a TPO 
Violation at residence on S Clay St. 
 
At 2015hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1375 for a report of a Reckless 
driver on Sr 83. 
 
08-18-22 
 
At 0949hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1377 to check the welfare check of 
a resident on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1009hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1378 to assist Holmes Fire District 
#1 at a business on W. Jackson St. 
 
At 1118hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1379 for a report of theft from a 
residence on S. Alexander St. 
 
At 1613hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1381 for a report of unauthorized 
use of a vehicle on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1708hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1382 to assist a citizen on Port 
Washington Rd. 
 
At 1915hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1383 for a report of a theft at a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 



At 2145hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1384 for a report of a suspicious 
person at a business on E. Jackson St.  
 
08-19-22 
 
At 0447hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1385 for a report of a suspicious 
vehicle at a business on S Washington St. 
 
At 1026hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1386 for a report of a juvenile 
problem at a residence on Lakeview Drive. 
 
At 1312hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1387 for a report of theft from a 
residence on S Washington St. 
 
At 1905hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1390 for an obstruction in the road 
on S. Washington St.  
 
08-20-22 
 
At 1421hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1391 for a report of drug 
paraphernalia in Lakeview Dr. 
 
At 1657hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1392 for a report of a reckless 
driver on SR 83. 
 
At 1815hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1393 for a report of a suspicious 
vehicle at a business on S Washington St. 
 
At 1928hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1394 for a report of theft at a 
business on S Washington St. 
  
At 2232hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1395 to assist another agency on 
S Washington St. 
 
08-21-22 
 
At 0047hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1396 for a fire alarm at a business 
on SR 39.  
 
At 2112hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1397 for a report of a disturbance 
on Hebron St. 
 
 
 
 
 



ACCIDENTS: 
 
 
08-18-22 
 
At 0714hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1376 for a report of two vehicle 
non injury crash on W Jackson St.   A report was filed. 
 
At 1255hrs this department responded to call 22MPD1380 for a report of two vehicle 
non injury crash on S. Washington St.   A report was filed 
 
08-19-22 
 
At 1330 this department responded to call 22MPD1388 for a report of a two vehicle 
injury crash on N Clay St. A report was filed. 
 
At 1341this department responded to call 22MPD1389  for a report of a two vehicle 
injury crash on W Clinton St. 


