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Week Ending 04-10-22 

INCIDENTS: 

04-04-22 
 
At 0207hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0531 for a report of a suspicious 
vehicle on Hebron St. 
 
At 0617hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0532 to assist a citizen on 
Massillon Rd. 
 
At 0654hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0533 for an alarm at a business on 
S. Washington St.  
 
At 1900hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0535 for a report of a suspicious 
person on Wooster Rd.  
 
At 2341hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0536 for a report of a barking dog. 
 
04-05-22 
 
At 0243hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0537 for a report of a disturbance 
on S. Washington St.  
 
At 1254hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0538 for a report of a fire on S. 
Alexander St.  
 
04-06-22 
 
At 1143hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0539 to assist another agency at a 
residence on S Washington St. 
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At 1315hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0540 to assist a motorist in 
unlocking their vehicle at a residence on S. Alexander St. 
 
04-07-22 
 
At 0512hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0541 for an alarm at closed 
business on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1021hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0542 for a report of theft from a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1033hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0543 for a juvenile problem at a 
residence on Rustic Drive. 
 
At 1245hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0545 for a report of theft from a 
business on Court St. 
 
At 1931hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0546 for a report of a parking 
problem on Glen Dr. 
 
At 2135hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0547 for a report of 
Telecommunications Harassment on Ledges Dr. 
 
04-08-22 
 
At 0902hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0548 for a report of a vehicle 
driving reckless on S. Washington St. 
 
At 0908hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0549 to assist a motorist in 
unlocking their vehicle at a business on E. Jackson St. 
 
At 1327hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0550 for a report of a suspicious 
person on the trail. 
 
At 1659hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0551 for a report of an alarm at a 
residence on Jackson St. 
 
At 1818hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0553 for a report of a animal call at 
a residence on Walnut St. 
 
At 1829hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0554 for a report of a animal call at 
a residence on Jackson St. 
 
At 2248hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0557 for a report of a suspicious 
person at a business on Hebron St. 
 



At 2341hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0558 for a report of a suspicious 
person on S Washington St. 
 
04-09-22 
 
At 2256hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0559 for a traffic stop on Wooster 
Rd. A citation was issued, and drug paraphernalia was recovered.   
 
04-10-22 
 
At 0201hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0560 to assist a citizen on N Mad 
Anthony St. 
 
At 1629hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0561 for an animal call on N. 
Washington St.  
 
 
Accidents: 
 
04-04-22 
 
At 1820hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0534 for a report of a two-vehicle 
accident with no injuries. Report taken. 
 
At 1759hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0552 for a report of one vehicle 
accident with no injuries on Jackson St. 
 
At 2011hrs this department responded to call 22MPD0556 for a report of a one vehicle 
accident with no injuries on S Washington St. 


